T €. S1.ue.- 33004/99 REGD. No. D. L.-33004/99

Che Gazette of India

O1.30.-UH.U.-31.-14112025-267 667
CG-MH-E-14112025-267667

HHTHTIOT
EXTRAORDINARY

AT | 1—ETeE 4
PART Il1—Section 4

TR & THTIAT
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

. 735] T2 el EaTe, A< 14, 2025/F (0 23, 1947
No. 735] NEW DELHI, FRIDAY, NOVEMBER 14, 2025/KARTIKA 23, 1947

W Red d&
(Foraeft szt farsmT)
(T Frata)

LG

s, 13 9%, 2025

Fareft qaT wey (AT SA) Farst 1 fAata) (i werrem) Rffgwmast, 2025

B, . HET.23(3)/(7)/2025-3 fawsft T 99 afarfa=rm, 1999 (1999 =T 42) #iY om=T 7,
1T 8 3T &Y 47 HT IT-GTT (2), FET T&T ATHAT AT TART FId T AT ord o Tagner faaeft
HqaT Y& (AT S garet &1 =ara) SfF=mmEet, 2015 [RAmE 12 S=a<t 2016 6 Sttee=«r 9,507
23(37)/2015-31r7aT], (P oo vt g AfemmEe wgr @ ), § Fuferfad dera fwar g, aaiqQ

1. "fera ar =i IT-

(i) == FAfFawTast v At 79T Faer (AT 3fiT garet &1 =arq) (G @eree) Sfa=mmEet, 2025 F27
SO

(ii) 7g FEfRTwTaet aEaT o= § 3HE TR 6l aE § AR N

7603 G1/2025 1)



2 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART I1I—SEC.4]

2. fafA=w 9 § deme:-
o ettt 4, {9 % -
(i) 3U-fafaer (1) ®, "7 92 orsal & T 9 'Uug Al ores WiaweATiua R ST
(i) 3U-Fafarm (2), @2 (F) |, A7 G2 9Teal F T U 'Uug HeiA ores wiaweriua R s
3. afq=w 15 9 werrer:-
o fafewmaet 4, fffaa 15 % -
(i) su-faffag (1), @< () ¥, "% a9 9rsat F =1 9 /T T oreg wiaeaTioq o s
(ii) S-Fafe=m (1) F 9o=q® ¥, 'UF a0 o5&l F T 9T, ‘DA a9 erex Fiaedtia R S
(iii) S-faffaw (2) ¥, "o o' oreat & T U, A9 a9 9reg wiaetiua fFFw s
Trfga 9t =™, it e

[FR=FTae-111/4/379T./471/2025-26]

e feoquft gw @t aRg EE F aEERT O69A- TEEIR-a6-1l, gve 3, I7-ave (i)
Rt 12.01.2016-SuHsme Fear 19(3), § warfora & it off sfiw =7 are § FerEr
Tonrer o

i. St "= 635 (5) =R 23.06.2017

ii. AT 23(R)/(2)/2019-3w& et 03 fawew 2019

iii. AT 23(R)/(3)/2020-31%& fa=i 31 AT= 2020

iv. AT 23(R)/(4)/2021-3m7T faeish 08 Seadt 2021

v. 1T 23(R)/(5)/2021-3met fa=rie 08 frdeae 2021

vi. T 23(R)/(6)/2025-37HT AT 24 I 2025
RESERVE BANK OF INDIA

(Foreign Exchange Department)
(CENTRAL OFFICE)

NOTIFICATION
Mumbai, the 13th November, 2025

Foreign Exchange Management (Export of Goods and Services) (Second Amendment) Regulations, 2025

F. No. FEMA 23(R)/(7)/2025-RB.—In exercise of the powers conferred by Section 7, Section 8 and sub-
section (2) of section 47 of the Foreign Exchange Management Act, 1999 (42 of 1999), the Reserve Bank of India
makes the following amendments to the Foreign Exchange Management (Export of Goods & Services) Regulations,
2015 [Notification No. FEMA 23(R)/2015-RB dated January 12, 2016] (hereinafter referred to as ‘the Principal
Regulations'), namely:

1. Short Title and Commencement:-

(i) These regulations may be called the Foreign Exchange Management (Export of Goods and Services) (Second
Amendment) Regulations, 2025



[9TT HHl—aTE 4] T T TSI © T 3

(i) They shall come into force from the date of their publication in the Official Gazette.
2. Amendment to Regulation 9:-
In the principal regulations, in regulation 9 -
(i) in sub-regulation (1) for the words ‘nine months’, the words ‘fifteen months’ shall be substituted.
(i) in sub-regulation (2), in clause (a) for the words ‘nine months’, the words ‘fifteen months’ shall be substituted.
3. Amendment to Regulation 15:-
In the principal regulations, in regulation 15 -
(i) in sub-regulation (1), in clause (i) for the words ‘one year’, the words ‘three years’ shall be substituted.
(if) in proviso to sub-regulation (1), for the words ‘one year’, the words ‘three years’ shall be substituted.
(iii) in sub-regulation (2), for the words ‘one year’, the words ‘three years’ shall be substituted.
ROHIT P. DAS, Regional Director
[ADVT .-I11/4/Exty./471/2025-26]

Foot Note: The Principal Regulations were Published in the Official Gazette of Government of India — Extraordinary
— Part-Il, Section 3, Sub-Section (i) dated 12.01.2016- G.S.R.N0.19(E) and subsequently amended vide
the following, namely as under:-

i. G.S.R.No. 635(E) dated 23.06.2017

ii. FEMA 23(R)/(2)/2019-RB dated December 03, 2019
iii. FEMA 23(R)/(3)/2020-RB dated March 31, 2020

iv. FEMA 23(R)/(4)/2021-RB dated January 08, 2021
v. FEMA 23(R)/(5)/2021-RB dated September 08, 2021
vi. FEMA 23(R)/(6)/2025-RB dated June 24, 2025

Uploaded by Dte. of Printing at Government of India Press, Ring Road, Mayapuri, New Delhi-110064
and Published by the Controller of Publications, Delhi-110054.



